
Artist Statement 

I often think of my work as a kind of gathering place. A collection of objects and marks 
sit at a dinner table: Things talk to people, people talk to things. There are arguments, 
flirtations, jokes. Each part and piece is independent, but should also mingle well. 

In the studio, my choices are governed by a feeling for narrative. I move until stories are 
revealed and then make decisions informed by those stories. Colors pinch at one 
another, shapes become affectionate, a group of sculptures sit together until they 
become lusty or envious. The subtle movement from conversation to conversation, from 
personality to personality, is told in the transition between shapes and forms.  

Though a story is discovered through the working process, the story is ongoing, and it 
remains open-ended, expanding or contracting through multiple frames. Small moments 
and gestures must work independently while also holding a place within ever-widening 
contexts. A sad figure sitting at a table tells a story. Her face, taken alone, tells a 
different story. A sculpture looks at her from across the room. A man looks at her and 
feels jealous of the sculpture. The viewer participates in the creation and discovery of 
these stories, forced to access meaning by deciphering between objects known and 
unknown, abstract and literal, foreign and familiar.  

Throughout the process, I try to keep my movements spontaneous. A finished drawing 
sits first at the base of one assemblage, then becomes the backdrop for a different 
piece. A found-object offers me a new shape to work with, and becomes part of the life 
of the studio. Pieces meet and marry, living happily together — unless they realize it is 
not for the best, and grow apart. In the end, I hope to achieve an effect something like 
jazz — compositions that are both formally and structurally rigorous, but that 
nevertheless retain a sense of openness and improvisation. 

In my own home my studio has begun to overflow into my domestic space, bringing 
ordinary and familiar objects into contact with the abstract and strange. In my recent 
work I have been creating large, site-specific installations that draw on this interaction, 
incorporating many individual pieces that, like an apartment (or an artwork), also cohere 
as a single thought.  

I have been addressing the questions of installation for a number of years. I first drew 
objects in space, and then later used objects in space to create drawings. In a series of 
installations, I laid out objects that, when viewed at a specific angle, resolved into a 
single coherent image. When seen from a given viewpoint, these compositions acquired 
the flatness of a picture, creating a new relationship between drawing and sculpture. 



Bio 

leif low-Beer lives and works in Brooklyn Berlin and Toronto. his sculptures and 
drawings have been shown at galleries in the United States and Canada and Europe, 
including a solo shows at wild Project and Beginnings gallery in New York, Okay 
Mountain in Austin and Buffalo Arts Center in Buffalo. He has presented large-scale 
installations at Socrates Sculpture Park in Queens and, most recently had a Solo Show 
at Space 1026 in Philadelphia.  
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